smﬁsa azp'ac'o’ Pt}
aamq@ic PTORBL
2.0388e VRS

dRridE NOAmRSS (3thTR) Jgechs, 2016
(20168 Dgesztich Jfechs o, — 06)

IIVF 3T NTDTROT BRIOHR, 19615, A, TR TEe0 2,000 QFecHE.

g\, faaiaamocs BORWDE  YUZEINVIPA Foorwd  NONmTT  wHR0DI,
19617, (19628 FRFEE SHACHT 13) DITW, IH TG TRBDITD CINITNNFHBOOT;

ST GO0 ReaTRE SOSZevRe BRETY IO Toz, DRITOBOOOT B3
ZNoHT0Z WHACHWITRY, J0TT:—~

1L XMogW WXh I WWPoE.~(1) 81 ORIODIVB/IY,  FDuF U NSOTT
(STHNTB) SHI0DT, 2016 0T FTORIZR.

(2) azd 85 BeBSe 0N WOITTR.

2. 48 JEOT 2RWIA.—~ FDOFRE  NTDWITT WRIODT, 19618 (19627 suorsd
SRHAHTD 13) (2D ‘amdadwozﬂ Brw HIODDEO eoGedTTNS) 43¢ TITRTEY,~

(i) (2)S¢ TTFTRBYS (V) DOBIY, VeDRBIZ,,

(i) (5)Be TTFTRTY,~

(D) () DOBTY "D THTT XD [HT CRTCRNW” H0W IJTNER "0
Dol CRTDCVNW” D0 IERYRY, B3030BAITT,.

(D) (V) LoBTY "W0B TOTT DIBHDT> TRITVCPNARD" 302 6.0 TATH

QTBERD aoaié_ao CHRTOCDND" 20w ZEAYR " T CeSoiingm” eﬁua’_an "DTB
Dol DTORATY Bemmmoingd” 20w a'jdrwm LIETRTON aééoiraﬂazziéscb

(%) TOOBFEY "t DRFYBTBAW TONY HTW T wea;"’mal AeORBZW)" wow

zonen "Hoed aar%man;cﬂ 00w Bemn DWIoT, WO SET, B[/, JeORIFT).
BERNE, SRV VR BNTWOTVT JoIT SHTOD X "gdcs u&’;FOﬁDRbJ_ CivloptelitLlo ol

DO mmsmal BUUISVIOR AL [N

2. 40 ZIONE IWMTB- DAY wLHARIE 4o TFOEOS  [nevode
TBTOBDFI), WEDRBWITI.

3. 113c Tpornm TR~ HDRO UOIHIDTE NIFe Joed (2) DB (3)de
EDTFOOAYY "B CRTBCRAYRY," H0W THINYA "0 TeRT TRTREWNTI," 0w
TN, waoira ze,*ssm
4. 128¢ Esiohola éc%“‘&. Thew RICHIT 123 TFTOT (DI NTTFTTY 33'3:9
CRHTWONAYRY," <0 TOAYR WO WWRT  CRTRORAYER,” 0w TONGI,
RSB ReBRTFTY,



wa;ezﬁm*a Sy oY BELE

3T0F W% NODWRTT HHICHI, 19613, (19628 FT0resd LHAODT 13),~

(i)  Noomen SA S BT, FCYRRED[TF, I aios:
(dual) SFZT), ST,

() THZ TREIPOE TTT 3008 NOD BFH BRNY BOVRMN FIF
BRI, VOFORPYTIE;

—ETH TR SREZT @wséﬁa"ocb Zoneds.

STOOT B3 DYILODT.



BF QT DITD To®
RTTT W) XFT XWWH

R, TIRIF
FORNFTEF(T)
FoOF LI GRS XY



(CIvitATeTnd
STOFUE NCDTS LRROHED, 19613 (19623 smortis SR T0; 13) NTBZE Fwn
XXX XXX XXX
4. qjﬁsims ThHOWRTIS msi BEBTLD.~ XXX XXX XXX

(R) @RFOUOWM TIFWT SeDelemRTS  BRICRI, 19610 LR0HY FAIWH,
BROLTOTT. \
XXX XXX XXX
(5) SRS FOWRTE BT INEBTHTNT BI03ROTH WRFODT, Tt [VOOT
=ony geedndeodn 3YXTTEY:-

(9) 200303 BLPLT FETY DHTRE TNTT DIWFLW TReTecnd
BT, SEDIFO.

() wowdos I AT TEed  IWHC  JYTRA H0B AT
ITTTIW), SEWITY. DBR®  TRTRORNLL DB 93T

Todeotd  FENPTRA  .0TH  AWRTT
WTHEHTY DT TRTCLNAW

BOOB), WOHINY DHROT ACDNAT VBJHOD FNTWODT  3TTVON ©EF ODI,
TOART @wom wFR Bowohawmod R DOFIBRAT TONE Q0B T O,

™~

ﬁeaﬁsigcf% .
XXX XXX XXX
4. ddﬁzgs E.'Sdz_:pm*a.— XXX XXX XXX

TTOD, BIords SernlcamolT @LACHT, 19613 (19620 IRFWE ©HAI0RNTH
12) wmwonnd wlohd qjﬁmdmdm DIRBRT  PTT0 BGemtdodn B €R0HIT
POTEINPTRNODR BRE PTETD Bescfodomd TRARBIT,

1. w30 QRpeus.- XX XX XX

(2) B TPTCWNRTRY, ETT mgﬁgﬁ ngD @k w3ohd, DEeedEzon
SIOOD DY O0IPENE BT QING  wETRN DRpeBEE TRABOZT, 9T DoIPKE
BT OTNE 3RSARORE T03ET NOLHRTR ATVTRHE :jdagﬁéqid%.

(3) T SpTONYE, Wedd sifa:ﬁ@éﬁ NOD @k wIoha), DRVecsEsod IO
BB OcWRINS DN ifaéﬂxaocaamé, T LOICLIWBY  LLTWORTCE0S OB, QY
SRRDTIOR DRBEBRRYRLET H[HOD FIT) FNOTHHVOHNIZEY,

XXX XXX XXX

12. 2300 SRTE DY SR WEES ITIB- (1) TR, CRIVOEVNYRY, Q00T
ﬁméﬁﬁﬁ plelaRRb =X evin! &;%oda?.q{ ABOTRES ¥ DSeTO0IRTEEY TovHNE OB
ENVEVIRER D BYW [TIE TRUE DTV WRTEIFE, B ACRNRWTTRTOT
ACHENG LZomoTzoN MUaééﬁmd &ﬁ?&oxéﬁéc%

XXX XXX XXX

TRrD DuEHIe0k, JWE F2G, Londel, &7, an 1020, 1000-ZEnd 43 SwewFs, 2016



FOURTEENTH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
NINTH SESSION

THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2016.
(L.A. Bill No. 06 of 2016}

A BIll further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act, 1961,

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers
Act, 1961. (Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) for the purposes hereinafter
appearing,

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the sixty seventh
year of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Pawn Brokers (Amendment) Act, 2016.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of section 4.- In the Karnataka Pawn Brokers Act,
1961. (Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962} (hereinafter referred to as the principal
Act}, in section 4,-

(1) in sub-section (2}, clause (c) shall be omitted.
(i1} in sub-section {5},-

(a) In clause (a), for the words "Rupees two thousand five hundred" the
words “"Rupees five thousand shall be substituted.

(b} In clause (b), for the words "Rupees two thousand five hundred"
and "Rupees one thousand two hundred and fifty" the words
"Rupees five thousand" and “Rupees two thousand five hundred”
shall be substituted respectively.

(c} In the proviso, for the words "by a fee at double the rates specified
above", the words “by an additional license fee at fifty percent of
the rate specified above. However, application submitted after
expiry of the Licence shall not be entertained" shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 4-A.- in section 4-A of the principal Act,
the first proviso shall be omitted.

4. Amendment of section 11.- in section 11 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (2) and (3) for the words "ten rupees” the words "two thousand
rupees” shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 12.- in section 12 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1) for the words "ten rupees" the words "two thousand rupees”
shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

It is considered necessary to amend the Karnataka Pawn Brokers
Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act No 13 of 1962) to,-
(i} simplify the licensing process for Pawn Broking and to avoid
dual license.
(iij revise the minimum value for auction of pledged pawn or

articles according to present money value.

Hence, the Bil_l.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

There 1s no extra expenditure involved in the proposed

Legislative measure,

H.S. MAHADEVA PRASAD
Minister for Co-Operation and Sugar

S. MURTHY
Secretary ([/C)
Karnataka Legislative Assembly



ANNEXURE

EXTRACT FROM THE KARNATAKA PAWN BROKERS ACT, 1961
(KARNATAKA ACT 13 OF 1962)
XX XX XX

4. Grant and renewal of licences.— XX XX XX

{c) that the applicant does not hold a licence under the 1 [Karnataka]l
Moneylenders Act, 1961.

XX XX XX

(5) Every application for the grant or renewal of a licence, shall be
accompanied by a fee at the following rates:—

(a) if the place at which the Rupees two thousand five hundred.
business is to be carried on is
not more than one.

(b) if the business is to be Rupees two thousand five hundred
carried on at more than for the principal place of business
one place. and Rupees one thousand two

hundred and fifty for each of the
other places.

Provided that where an application i1s made after the expiry of the
period prescribed by rules in respect of such application, it shall be
accompanied by a fee at double the rates specified above.

XX XX XX

4A. Conditions of licence.— XX XX p. 8. ¢

Provided that the security deposit made by a licensee under the
provisions of the Karnataka Money Lenders Act, 1961 (Karnataka Act 12
of 1962) shall be deemed to be the security deposit for the purposes of this
Act also.

XX XX XX
11. Redemption of pledge.— XX XX XX

{2) A pledge pawned for a sum not exceeding ten rupees, if not
redeemed within the period of redemption and days of grace, shall at the end
of the days of grace become the pawnbroker’s absolute property.

(3) A pledge pawned for a sum exceeding ten rupees shall further
continue to be redeemable until it is disposed of as provided in this Act,
although the period of redemption and days of grace have expired.

XX XX XX

12. Sale of pledge and inspection of sale book.—{1) A pledge
pawned for a sum exceeding ten rupees shall, when disposed of by the
pawnbroker, be disposed of by sale by auction and not otherwise, and the
sale shall be conducted in accordance with such rules as may be prescribed.

XX XX XX

(Government Press, Vikasa Soudha, Bengaturu, P7, W.D.. Copies 1020, 4™ Mareh, 2016





